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while contracts uses the same military weapons the developer has used in its
previous titles, sniper ghost warrior 2 is a totally different animal in terms of

the tech. the weapons are brand new. ci has taken the time to draw inspiration
from real world firearms, and it shows. the weapons feel solid, and their design

is balanced between power and weight so that you feel like youre not at a
disadvantage no matter what weapon you choose. there are also a fair number

of small (read: not just a knife or a sword) and large weapons, and youll be
able to find your sweet spot for each of them. while the player is always going
to be able to survive, theres also a story to follow. the narrative of the game

starts after the events of the first game. the enemies from the previous sniper
ghost warrior 2 title are back, and this time around, youre their target. the
game offers up some new enemies to battle, but i never had any problems
with enemies. as with contracts, i was able to easily get through the game
without ever having to call in support, and the game never felt like it was

bogging me down with complexity. the soldier that you just killed is the leader
of the group, he knows the location of the next set of enemies. follow him as

he runs away from the location of the enemies. kill him again, this time,
however, use a different sniper rifle. the shotgun, which is new to this sequel,

is perfect for killing the enemy leader while he is running away from the
remaining group of soldiers. sniper ghost warrior: contracts is part simulation,
part game. if you want to play a game, look elsewhere. if you want to sim, this
is the game for you. you should, however, be aware of the following, as well as

the following issues: the camera is your friend. its much easier to see where
youre shooting from if youre looking through the scope. if youre not looking
through the scope, you will need to guess at the position of the enemy. if

youre not looking through the scope, it will be a lot harder to take them out.
the game takes place in a single level, with no in-game map. its as simple as

that.
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sniper ghost warrior contracts is a good game, but it's not a great game. it
doesn't get you to the next level, as it offers nothing different that no other

first-person shooter has already offered. it doesn't satisfy even the most basic
of expectations, and that is disappointing for a game that comes from the

mind of ghost games. shoot the three enemy soldiers in the back to eliminate
them and free your wayward soldier, who youll need to lead you away from
the fenced area. note that as you walk away from the zone, you will get a

notification telling you how much money youve earned. follow the marker to
the place where you need to retrieve the soldier. pick up your sniper rifle and
follow him through the door leading to the second stage. when you emerge,
the soldier is over there. take him back to the first stage and complete the

mission. youre now about to enter a third stage. youre facing a small number
of enemy soldiers, led by a heavily armed man. handily, he has a red circle

around his head that tells you that he has a heavy-duty weapon in his hands.
take him out first to free the other soldiers, then theres a free-roaming car
parked nearby. use the sniper rifle to take out the driver, then hit the brake

pedal to run over him and kill him. while youre driving, youll need to follow the
line of the car to the right, to the place where your soldier is waiting. follow the

soldier through the door on the left and kill the last three enemies, then pick
up your sniper rifle and leave. sniper ghost warrior 2 is a fantastic game for

snipers. it caters to those who like to play a long, involved sniper game, rather
than the fast, linear kill-fests favoured by many other games. the ai is very

good, and it provides challenging, satisfying gameplay. 5ec8ef588b
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